A special meeting of the Adams Township Board of Supervisors was held on May 21, 2015 at 3:00 p.m. at
the Adams Township Municipal Building, 690 Valencia Road, Adams Township, Mars, PA.

Present at the meeting were Supervisors Donald C. Aiken, Linda E. Lees, and Edward L. Vogel, Public
Works Manager John Hock and Secretary Janet Lubbert.

Chairman Aiken called the meeting to order at 3:10 p.m.

The secretary opened and read the bid results as follows:

Neville Terminal McClymonds

Services Supply & Transit
#8 Limestone no bid 25.57
#67 Limestone 23.22 20.72
2A Modified 22.87 20.25
1B Special no bid 21.69
#8 River no bid 38.00
#8 Type H no bid 29.73
Natural Sand 16.92 15.34
#3 River no bid 18.19
#3 Limestone 24.32 20.25
#1 Limestone 24.32 20.25
R4 Rip Rap 24.97 20.25
#4 Limestone 24.32 20.25
#2B Gravel 20.07 18.09

Russell
Standard Suit-Kote
Bituminous Material 2.047 2.003
E-3 Emulsion 1.670 1.763
E-3M Emulsion 1.902 1.899
Russell
Standard Suit-Kote

Paver 354.00 350.00
Tandem Steel Roller 99.00 99.00
Pneumatic Roller 68.00 80.00
Triaxle Dump 109.00 110.00
Tractor Power Broom 75.00 80.00
Motorized Chipper 135.00 190.00
Pugmill with operator 180.00 190.00
Pneumatic Tire Loader 99.00 99.00
Supervisor with truck 42.00 50.00
Milling machine for key cuts 85.00 90.00

On a motion by Linda E. Lees and seconded by Edward L. Vogel, the bids were accepted and action on
awarding the bids was tabled. All were in favor.

On a motion by Edward L. Vogel and seconded by Linda E. Lees, the meeting was adjourned at 3:20 p.m.
All were in favor.

Janet L. Lubbert, Secretary



